City of Harrington
AGENDA
City Council Workshop
City Hall, 106 Dorman Street
February 9, 2015
6:30 p.m.

Call to Order
Pledge of Allegiance

1. 2012 International Residential, Building, and Property Maintenance
Codes

2. Railroad station
3. Budget
4. Charter change —term limits for Mayor and Council

5. Public Comments (2 minute limit)
The public comment segment of the Council Meeting is the time that the City extends the
opportunity to the general public to share with us your questions, thoughts, comments,
concerns, and complaints. Those wishing to step forward to take advantage of the public
comment segment will be provided two (2) minutes. While City government is interested in
taking appropriate action, current law prohibits City Council from engaging in discussion of
any comments made or taking any action.

6. City Council Comments

Adjourn

Posted 02/02/2015
Kelly Blanchies
Clerk of Council

Note: 29 Del.C. 810004(e)(2). Agenda items as listed may not be considered in
sequence. This agenda is subject to change to include additional items including
Executive Sessions or the deletion of items including Executive Sessions, which arise at
the time of the meeting. If there are questions or special accommodations are needed,
please contact Kelly Blanchies at City Hall, 398-4476 (at least 72-hours in advance of
the meeting for special accommodations).



RemingTON
VERNICK
«sBracH
ENGINEERS

CITY OF HARRINGTON
2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING/RESIDENTIAL CODE ADOPTION

To; Terry Tieman, City Manager
From: David Naples
Drate; 1720415

[*ursuant to your request, a review was conducted ot the 2012 International Building Code and the 2012
International Residential Code in an eflorl Lo recommend their adoplion by the City of Harringlon,

Char office has experience with the adoplion and enforcement of these codes in the jurisdiction of Kent
County Delaware. Accordingly, we have found that their process and their intent for the enforcement of
these codes parallel that of the City of Harrington., Adoption of these codes promates uniformity with the
surrounding jurisdictions and improves the quality of construction being ottered in the City of Harrington.

To that end, our office would recommend that the City of Harrington install language in the City Code
that adopts either of the [ollowing scenarios,

Scenario #1 adopls the Kent County Supplement but will require additional modifications to the code for
the City of Harrington and to stay consistent with the original intent of the IBC and TRC as written. The
Kenl County Supplement essentially replaces Chapter 1 (Administration) of the IBC and IRC,

Scenario #£2 adopts the codes essentially as written, including Chapter 1, but makes some modifications
to stay generally consistent with Kent County, This scenario stays truer 1o the codes and represents a less
complex adoption of the codes.

1. Reference adherence to the Kent County Supplement to the International Building Code/2012
and the International Residential Code/2012 that went into effect in Kent County on 1071714,
The following modifications to the Kent County Supplement are also recommended:

a.  Table of conlents ™ delete section 103 — Division of Inspection and Enflorcement

b, Delete section 103 that recognizes the “Division of Inspections and Enforcement.”

co ALBL0 - \Iudl['n;dtmub - rephlw Division of Inspections and Enforcement with City of
[Tarrington

d. Delete A104.10.1 — Flood Hazard Areas

e Delete A105.2  work exempt from permits: this is already established i Cily Code
section :

o ALD5.2.4 — Apricultural and farm buildings - replace Division of Inspections and
Enforeement with City of Harringlon

g, A0S — Application for permit; nplacu: Division of Inspection and Enforcement with
City ol Harrington.

h. Delete AL05.5 - Completion of t.ﬂns-[;ruumn

L Al05.6.1 - Stop Work Orders; 1l.,|‘.nlacv.=} Kent County with City of Harrington

i Delete A106.2.1 - Acceptable datum %,

Corlserikblanchioe CITY OF AR RING TORApp Dt Loce A ieresn W indows' Cemperary Internet Frles Conten L O ook s B I TROSS20 1 2
[BC adeption recamumendation ceme.doec



k. Delete A107.2.7 — Information for construction in flood hazard areas
. ALOR | — replace Kent County with City of Harringlon
m. A109.2 - revise to read City of Harrington fee schedule; Chapter 180
no ALO93 | Building permit valuation/cvaluation  replace Marshal and Swifl with most
recent edition of the International Code Council Building Yaluation Data information,
o Al0%4 1 Aller the Bt permitling  replace Kent County with Cily of Harrington
p.  Delete A10%.6 — refunds /
q. Al10.3.7  replace Division of Inspections and Enforcement with City of Harrington
r. Al11.2 - Certificate Issued; rcplzu:u: Division of Inspections and Enforcement with Ciry
of Harringlon
8. Section 113 — referdo City f"mTu., seetion 7-4
. Section 114 — Variances - Lnnmg yariances, refer to Chapter 440;
1. Delete AllS.4 # Vielation and penaltics
v. All6.l — Stop work order - replace Kent County with City of Harrington
w, Delete adupﬁlun o IBC Appendix H - Signs
x. IRC section R403.1.1 — Minimum size; dL{c[L execeptions
v, Delete adophion of IRC Appendix R I’»Idl‘l\{\tstLlled Housing {based on adoption of
proposed Ordinance 14-15)
2. Adopt chaptl.r I of TRC and IRC codes with the following modifications, e
a. 301.2 (Climate and geographic design criteria)— per Kent County Supplement \
b, 31175 (Stairs) — adopt revisions as per Kent County Supplemaent \
¢, 313 —(Sprinklers) — delete in its entirety (same as Kent County Supplement) A
d. 403, 1.1 (Fooling sizes) — adopt revisions as per Kenl Counly Supplement BUT NOT
ADOPT EXCEPTIONS
e Add section 614 (Pole Buildings) - per Kent County Supplement
f.  Add section 615 (Pole Buildings) - per Kent County Supplement
e, Add section 616 (Pole Buildings) - per Kent County Supplement
h.  Add section 617 (Pole Buildings) - per Kent County Supplement
i, Chapter 11 (Energy Efficiency)— delete in its entirety; refer to current adopted State
Energy Code (same as per Kent County Supplement)
j. DPart V11 - Chapters 25 through 33 (Plumbing) - delete in their entivety; refer to current
\ adopled Stale Plumbing Code (same as per Kent County Supplement)
: k. Part VII - Chapters 34 through 43 (Electrical) - delete in their entirety: refer to current
\‘ adopted Stute Electrical Code (same as per Kent County Supplement) /
b 1. Appendix G (Swimming Pools, Spas, and Hot Tubs)  adopt without changes /
m. Appendix J (Existing Buildings and Structures) — adopt without changes /
n.  Appendix M (Home Day Care — -3 Occupancy) — adopt without changes -
\ - ; i
Respectlully E‘Tﬂ:‘ﬁrmed— e b o )

David A, Naples, MCP

Remington. Vernick & Beach Engincers
University Office Plaza

Bellevue Building

262 Chapman Road, Suite 1035

Newark, DE 19702

Collzergkblapchies CITY OF HARR DG TR A ppDalat Local MicrosclWindows Temporary Infeme Files/Contenl Chatloek BRI TOHS 5201 2
IR adaption recommendation mema doc



Adoption of 2012 International Building, Residential, and
Property Maintenance Codes

Delete Article |, Handicapped Parking, from Chapter 102, Building Standards.

Sections that will appear in the ordinance as changes to the International Code book:

Building Code

101.1 Insert: City of Harrington

» 1612.3 Insert: City of Harrington
* 1612.3 Insert: with the most recently enacted
s 3412.2 Insert: the effective date of the adoption of this Code
Residential Code
« R101.1 Insert: City of Harrington
« R301.2(1) Insert: -
WIND DESIGN SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM VANTER
DESIGN TERE ICE BARRIER
IGROUND SEISMIC SUMMER UNDER- AR | MEAN |ASSUMED
SNOW |Speed? | Topographic| DESIGN Frost line Wet bulb/Ory | LAYMENT FLOOD FREEZING [ANMNUAL|  SOIL
LoAD |imph) | Effects'  |CATEGORY |Weathering: | depth® | Termite: bul REQUIRED? |  HAZARDSE INDEX' | TEMP! | BEARING
06/01/1977
07/07 2014
[33007/07/2014
— 337 07/07/2014 2000
25 g0 Mo A5 B Severe 24" | To heavy 89/75 Mo |341 07/07/2014 325 56.2 psf
For 5i: 1 pound per square foot = 0.047% kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s
a. Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy
the structural requirements of this code. The weathering column shall be filled in with the
weathering index (i.e., "negligible,” "moderate” or “severe”} for concrete as determined from the
Weathering Probability Map Figure R301.2(3). The grade of masonry units shall be determined from
ASTMC 34,C55,C62,C73,C90,C 129, C145, C 216 or C 652,
b. The frost line depth may require deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403.1(1). The jurisdiction
shall fill in the frost line depth column with the minimum depth of foeting below finish grade.
c. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on
whether there has been a history of local subterranean termite damage.
1

MNotes for Adoption of 2012 International Codes




d. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed
map [Figure 301.2(41A]. Wind exposure category shall be determined on a site-specific basis in
accordance with Section R301.2.1 4.

e. The outdoor design dry-bulb temperature shall be selected from the columns of 97 % - percent
values for winter from Appendix D of the International Plumbing Code. Deviations from the
Appendix D temperatures shall be permitted to reflect local climates or local weather experience as
determined by the building official.

f. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the Seismic Design Category determined from
Section R301.2.2.1.

g. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with [a) the date of the jurisdiction’s entry into the
Mational Flood Insurance Program [date of adoption of the first code or ordinance for management
of flood hazard areas), (b) the date(s) of the Flood Insurance Study and (c) the panel numbers and
dates of all currently effective FIRMs and FBEFMs or other flood hazard map adopted by the authority
having jurisdiction, as amended.

h. In accordance with Sections RS05.2.7.1, R905.4.3, R905.5.3, R905.6.3, R905.7.3 and R905.8.3, for
areas where the average daily temperature in January is 252 F (-40 C) or |ess, or where there has
been a history of local damage from the effects of ice damming, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part
of the tahle with “YES." Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with "NO."

i. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the 100-year return period air freezing index
(BF-days) from Figure R403.3(2) or from the 100-year (99%) value on the Mational Climatic Data
Center data table “Air Freezing Index- USA Method ({Base 329 Fahrenheit)” at
www.hcde.noaa.gov/fpsf. html.

j. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the mean annual temperature from the
National Climatic Data Center data table "Air Freezing Index- USA Method (Base 220 Fahrenheit)”
at www . ncdc.noaa.gov/fpst.html.

k. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.5, where there is local historical data documenting structural
damage to buildings due to topographic wind speed-up effects, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part
of the tahle with "YES.” Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NO” in this part of the table,

I. Including all subsequent amendments and/or the most current revision thereof.

* R311.7.5 Delete existing section and insert:

R311.7.5 Stair treads and risers. 5tair treads and risers shall meet the reguirements of this
section. For the purposes of this section all dimensions and dimensioned surfaces shall be
exclusive of carpets, rugs or runners.

R311.7.5.1 Risers. The maximum riser height shall be 8-1/4 inches (203.6 mm). The riser shall be
measured vertically between leading edges of the adjacent treads. The greatest riser height
within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by mare than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm). The
riser height at landings with hinged doors shall be measured from the landing vertically to the
top of the threshold (not the compression strip). The riser height at landings with sliding doors
shall be measured from the landing vertically to the top of the highest projection of the door
track. Risersshall be vertical or sloped from the underside of the nosing of the tread above at
an angle not more than 30 degrees (0.51 rad) from the vertical. Open risers are permitted
provided that the opening between treads does not permit the passage of a 6-inch-diameter
{102 mm) sphere.

MNotes for Adoption of 2012 International Codes



Exception: The opening between adjacent treads is not limited on stairs with a total rise
of 8 = 1/4 inches (209.55 mm) or less,

R311.7.5.2 Treads. The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches {229 mm). The tread depth shall
be measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacent
treads and at a right angle to the tread’s leading edge. The greatest tread depth within any
flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems Delete in its entirety.
Add new section and subsections:

Section R614
Post Frame Buildings

R614.1 Definitions.

POST FRAME BUILDING. A structural building frame consisting of a wood truss or rafters
connected to vertical timber columns or sidewall posts, which function as the principal
gravity and load resisting elements of the building. A building used for motor vehicles is
considered a garage and must meet the requirements in section R309 as well as Section
614 of this code.

614.2 Plan Submittals.

R614.2.1 Design loads. Plans are required to meet the minimum design loads noted in
Table R301.2{1}. Uplift reaction forces involved are required to be provided.

R614.2.2 Truss design drawings. Truss design drawings are required at the time of plan
submittal. The building plans should specify the permanent bracing for cords and webs
to meet the bracing requirements shown on the truss design drawings.

R614.2.3 Size, grade, and species of wood members. All lumber shown on the submitted
drawings should identify the size, grade and species or species group. Any engineered

lumber should be identified by the product name, size and stress grade.

R614.2.4 Isolation of siding. Methods and materials to isolate steel siding from
preservatively treated lumber should be specified and detailed on the submitted plans.

R614.2.5 Connection of truss carrier to bearing post. Submitted plans shall specify a
bearing notch, properly designed bearing block, or other means for positive load transfer.

Motes for Adoption of 2012 International Codes



R614.2.6 Fastener schedule. Submitted plans are required to include a fastener schedule
completely describing the fasteners and quantities required at each connection. Power
driven nails should specify the type, diameter and length.

R614.2.7 Roofing and siding diaphragms. Submitted plans shall include metal roof and
wall panel thickness, fastener type and size, and the fastener pattern for roof and siding
panels. If stitch screws are required to attach metal sheet-to-sheet, the plans should
show the locations. Shingled roofs shall meet the requirements of Section R905,

R614.3 Footings

R614.3.1 Footing depth. Footings for post frame structures shall extend a minimum of 40
inches {914 mm) below grade.

R614.3.2 Footing size. Footings for all post frame structures shall be sized to support the
loads imposed. Minimum footing sizes for all post frame structures shall be 18 inches
(457 mm) diameter and a minimum of 12 inches (203 mm) thick concrete under the
support posts.

R614.3.3 Resistance to uplift. A lumber cleat shall be attached to the bottom of all vertical
support posts to resist uplift.

Exception: Other means to resist uplift may be used and should be noted on the
submitted plans.

R&614.4 Frame Construction

R614.4.1 Preservative treatment. All wood in contact with the ground shall he
preservatively treated meeting the requirements of Section R319.

R614.4.2 Support posts. Support posts fabricated from multiple plies shall have the
number of plies of lumber, lumber species, grade, and connection system between plies
noted.

R614.4.3 Truss carrier spans. The allowable spans for truss carriers fabricated of
dimensional lumber shall not exceed the values set forth in Tables R614.4.4(1) through
R614.4.4{3). Spans exceeding the values set forth in Tables R614.4.4(1) through
R614.4.4{3) shall be engineered.

Motes for Adoption of 2012 International Codes



Table R614.4.4(1)
Truss Carrier Spans

48" 0.C. Support Post Spacing

Truss Spacing | Header Supporting » (2)2x6 (2)2x8 (2)12x10 (2)2x12
- Ibst Ibsb Ibsb Ibsh
Douglas fir - Larch [ 12m 1584 2021 2458
Hem — fir 948 1250 1595 1940
24" Southern yellow pine 1138 1500 1914 1328
Spruce — pine - fir 285 1167 1489 1811
Table R614.4.4(2)
Truss Carrier Spans
72" 0.C. support Post Spacing
[Truss Spacing | Header Supparting * 1212x6 (2)2x8 1212x10 (212112
Ihss Ibsh Ibs? kst
- | Douglas fir - Larch B62 1186 1513 1841
) Herm — fir 710 936 1195 1450
24 Southern yellow pine 851 1124 1434 1744
" Spruce - pine - fir 663 874 1115 1356
Douglas fir - Larch 1130 1584 2021 2458
Herm - fir i 948 1250 1595 1840
35 Southern yellow pine 1138 1500 1914 VEVE
" Spruce - pine - fir 885 1167 1489 1711
Table R614.4.4(3)
Truss Carrier Spans
96” 0.C. Support Post Spacing
Truss Spacing  [Header Suppaorting ® (2]2x6 {2)2x8 {2)2x10 {2)12x12
Ihso sk lhsk [bse
Douglas fir - Larch 487 722 1162 1413
i Hem — fir T 4en 719 917 1115
Southern yellow pine 654 2a2 1100 1339
Spruce — pine - fir 474 671 256 1041
Douglas fir - Larch 847 1360 2021 2458
) Hem — fir 800 1250 1595 1940
48 Southern yellow pine 1138 1500 1914 2328
Spruce — pine - fir 824 1167 1489 1811

a. Tabulated values assume B2 grade [umber.
b. Truss reactions = Total load.

Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency Delete in its entirety and refer to current adopted State Energy

Code.

Part VIl Plumbing Delete in its entirety and refer to current adopted State Plumbing Code.

Part VIl Electrical Delete in its entirety and refer to current adopted State Electrical Code.

Adopt Appendix G Swimming Pools, Spas, and Hot Tubs

Motes for Adoption of 2012 International Codes




Adopt Appendix J Existing Buildings and Structures

Adopt Appendix M Home Day Car — R-3 Occupancy

Property Maintenance Code

101.1 Insert: City of Harrington
103.5 Insert: The fees are as set forth in Chapter 180, Municipal Fees.

106, Violaitons Delete in its entirety and adopt the current section from Chapter 305, Property
Maintenance.

107, Notices and Orders Delete in its entirety and adopt the current section from Chapter 305,
Froperty Maintenance.

112.4 Insert: the amount set forth in Chapter 180, Municipal Fees; the amount set forth in
Chapter 180, Municipal Fees

302.4 Insert: six inches
304.14 Insert: May 1; October 1
602.3 Insert: November 1; April 1

602.4 Insert: November 1; April 1

MNotes for Adoption of 2012 International Codes



A ’i’%

Railroad station and Charter change — term limits for
Mayor and Council will be discussed at the meeting. No
information included in packets.



GENERAL FUND INCOME
Greneral Government [ncome

Taxation - Annual
Taxation - P&
Franchise Fee
Interest

Misc

City Events

Legal Fees Billed

NSF atid Admin Fees Billed
Transfer Fram Capilal Resery
Interfund Recelpt - Water
Interfund Receipt - Sewer
Total General Grovernmenl

Depactment Income

ity Hall

Folice Dept

Public Worls

Library

Traszh

Fire Dopt

Parkis & Rec
Planning & mspections

Total Dept [ncome

TOTAL GENERAL FUND INCOME
Froprictary Fund Income

Water Income
Waste Water Incomme

Total Proprietary [nceme

TOTAL CITY OF HARRINGTON INCOME

GENERAL FUND EXPENSES

General Government Expenses
Department Expenses

Clty Hall

Police Dept

Fublic Works

Library

Trash

Fire Dopt

Parks & Rec

Planning & Inspections

Tuotal Dopt Expenses
GENEHRAL FUND BALANCE
TOTAL GENERAL FUND EXPENSES

Froprietary Fumd Expenses

Water Expenses
Waste Water Expenses

Tutal Dept Expenses
Proprietacy Fund Balance

TOTAL PROPRIETARY FUND EXPENSES

TOTAL CITY OF HARRINGTON EXPENSES

City of Harrington
YTD Bueclget Vs Actual

Perind Ending December, 2014

12/31/14 Annual $ Variance vs
Actual  6mosEst Total ad Budget Budpet % of Budget
§ LOBEOTT 3 § LUBG07F 5 LOBGHET & (910 100%
] S496 3 ThE9t § 131an s 15000 % :1,111:}] SR
3 19428 3 19500 3§ 33928 § ags00 8 128 E
H 1,572 s L6008 3,172 & 5500 f (2,328 G2
5 &sal 5 ay s 1Llal % 400 3 (2,239) 34%
s 1165 % 1165 & 2330 % adan % (LU70) G
5 139 8 H 229 4 -4 429 L
¥ ot - % o0 3 - 3 El %
§ 3 6500 % hA0 f Rl 35 - 10a%
] § 31817 % 31417 § 31817 8 1000%,
i § 130802 § 130802 3 130802 5 100
§114017 0§ 19%EYE § 1314495 5 LIZ2006 S [7.51L) 9%,
H - 3 QURETE 3 293,975 § 293975 % - 100%,
ki 171,343 5 145497 4§ JieBD 5 29300 % A0,5440 107,
s a5 61,338 5 61978 § 51938 § 2 1o,
] 82774 % 1A037 5 THELL & 7ROCO0 % 1811 102%,
& 12B437 & 113353 5 241990 8 24lMs 4 ) 100%
5 25361 ¢ 35572 & 57,9331 % E1562 (3,627 REE
] 29421 % TATO § 136791 § 15G72E 3 6 100%
L] 122647 § 31,934 % 211,581 % 1973530 3 11-.3”5_1_ L7
$ 0 A04023 F BLEATE F 1419899 § 1385822 3§ 33077 L0024
§ 1718940 § 1015454 § 2734395 3 aTumsus S 255867 L01%
§ 0 2BL21% 4 2Re52S F 567744 § 0 G5TEOT S 9,937 L02%
§ 917494 3 326239 4 1643733 5 1535521 % 8212 1014
i LOUHTI3 5 L1IZFe4 3 2211477 3 1,193318 19,149 107%
3 zoi7e54 § 238318 0§ 4045873 3§ 4002156 § 43,716 1%
$ 0 1zsm0ld % 4%z § 21308 215460 5 48 TR
§  l6e327 3 165577 0§ E20004 § 0 3zmSHE S 1314 L
§ 0 475958 0§ 491591 § 967538 § 974032 8 [7.3%4]) 94
§ 0 1544ad $ 0 154713 3 309179 § 325350 6 (15171 95%
3 75,892 5 07372 3% 173285 % 178411 6 [4,146] 9g%;
115309 3 125481 3 241990 5 241902 % [ 1001,
5 E055% 5 59313 3 118Bs6 3 125340 § [6.474] 95%,
3 24368 5 BOAY 5 ladEsF 5 17L755 § (6,205 el
5 95352 % B2 5 1742E0 5 1aTamr g 26,298 LR,
S 1ZI54E00 F L234471 5 2479891 5 2492330 § [12,459) e
5 ITOUE § 13 3 37,980
B 1083404 3 13470963 § 2734395 § 2T0862%F 3 25,567 103
J 118994 3§ 27131 § MH185  § 4R1A71 & {1.—1.24I’:.: 975
§ 500581 3 1084723 4 15ASS04 4 1835521 % (50,217 7%
§_ 61YS57S § 1411854 § 2031420 & 2096372 % [63.453]
s 1B04B 3 w430 f B3 612
5 6lB575 § LAL1854 5 2211477 8 2193320 § 1149 101%:
}' 1,973, 0049 .‘j_ 5 "."_5& A6 5 49450872 4 4902,1546 % 43.714 10204



City of Harrington - General Government

Budget ¥s. Actual - December, 2014
50% of Budget

Account 1d T Accaunt Deseript 2015 Budgated "2015 Actual '8 mos Esti | Total """ 'S Over Budget ! % of Budget |
Revenues:
1 0-10-4001 Property Taxes b 1086987 § 1,0880¢7 & - §  108ELCTT & 10 100%,
10-10-4002 Franchise Fee b 38,600 § 16,428 § 189530 § 38928 § 3128 101%
10-10-4005 City Evenis k3 3400 % 1165 § 1,165 § 2330 % 11070} G9%:
10-10-4020 MEF and Admin Fees Billed i - ¥ a0 5 - § =1 a0 0%
10-10-4021 Lagel Faes Billed 3 - % 41 5 - & 420 % 478 ang
10-10-4108 Fan & Interest 3 15,000 3% 5,486 § 76594 % 13,180 § 11,810) G5%
10-10-4104 Mizs Income 3 3400 5 661 & 00 % 1,181 § {2, 238) 34%
101041410 Interasl Income 5 5800 5 1572 % 1600 % 3172 5 (2,328) 56%
10-18-2901 Transfer Fram Capital Reserva 5 E.500 5 - % G500 % G500 5 - T00%
J0-10-4310 Interfund Racelpt - Walar 3 nair s - % 31,517 & 31,817 & . 100%,
'E'-1{I-491f Enter"unu:l Raceipt - S&war 5 130,802 & 3 13[: 802 5 130,802 % -
= Y AT IS 59,578 18 I 314 498 TS TIN5

Expandiluras;
10-10-5001 Salaries b 20,000 % G.O00 5 10,000 & 16,800 5 13,1009 45%
10-10-5081 Fica F 1530 % 528 & 76§ 1,293 5 (237 35%
12-10-5052 Ciher PR Taxes 3 - 3 54 ¥ 54 8 54 0%
10-10-5053 State Unemplaymenl Tax 3 a0 5 173 % 60 % 423 5 343 528%
10-10-80402 Advertising 5 1,250 § 1,108 3 1,108 § (142} 294
10-10-6005 Commercial Insurance 5 12500 3 805 § G400 3 13,305 § ans 10EY,
10-10-8007 Duas, Licenses & Meetings 5 4,000 § 4,787 % - 3 47387 % TAT 120%
10-10-6008 Elaclion Expenses 5 1,000 § - § 1000 8 1.000 % - 100%,
10-10-6009 Evant & Communily Suppart 5 11,250 & 10,382 % 869 3 11250 3% - 100%
10=13-6010 Employes Crug/Fhysical’Background 5 anc % 147 & 200 5 M7 3 (554) B
10-10-6012 Travel & Food i A 41 5 8 5 50 % 0 100%,
10-10-6051 Computer & Software k3 20,000 F 12924 § fore 5 20,000 3 - 100%
10-10-6053 Lease Equipment Expanse b 500 % Ta4 § - & TE4 5 264 153%
10-10-8054 hisc Expanse I 1700 % 89 § 06§ 188§ {1,511) 11%
10-10-8055 Printing & Poslage 3 550 % 135 § 135 % 270 8 [2ad; A43%,
10-10-8055 Cifice Supplies 5 500 % a7 % 150 % 07§ {203} 41%
10-10-86062 Audit Fees 3 29,000 3 45140 % 40,880 § 85,000 § - 100%
10-10-8063 Admin Fees 5 2500 § BA10 § - 3 410 % 3,810 256%
10-10-B086 Enaineering 5 3000 0§ 1,655 % 1445 % jooh % - 100%
10-10-6068 Lagal Fags 5 40000 5§ 23843 % 16,057 3 40000 § 100%,
12-10-6063 Payroll Service Fees 3 BLOO 5 24909 % aoat 3 G000 § - 100%,
19-10-B072 Heat & Elecxru:. $ 150 § g4 £ BB 5 150 % - 100%

! : L e - = Sz 100%




City of Harrington - City Hall
Budget Vs, Actual - December, 2014

Biidgeted 72015 Actual "7 "6 Month Est | 'Total T '$ Over Budget” % of Budget ]
Revenues.
10-83-45910 Intarfund Receipt - Water 3 57517 & - § 57517 & 57,517 & . 100%
10- 5:3-4911 in!erfun:! HEI;EIpt Sewer i 235458 % - $ 236 458 % 236,458 § H}‘.]
TN Revenue Tofal T s I mm:sm.m 100%]

346813 35,928 5 1 316

' 'meﬁmmé LA

Expandiiuras;
10-83-5001 Salaries 5 223803 5 09580 3 113,086 5 221576 3 T3 100%
12-83-5051 FiCa, 5 17,098 § 8167 5 3720 5 16,887 § {211 aang,
10-83.5052 Other PR Taxas ¥ 1483 5 g2 § 671 & 1863 % 150 112%,
10-83-5081 Stata Unampioyment Tax ] 27205 a5 2aar 0§ 2707 % (22 9%
10-B3-5071 Fansion b 11,625 & TET4 § T 12728 % 1,103 109%
10-83-5072 Health Insurance % 42160 & 22174 8 21467 § 43635 3 1,475 103%
10-83-6011 SaminaraTraining k3 3000 % 1,795 & 200 % 1985 § 11,00E) 1.5
10-82-8012 Traval & Faod i 800§ 23 5 300 % 623 3 (1 ran,
10-83-6013 Clesning Service i 2300 % 1020 % 1020 % 2040 5 {250 800G
10-83-EC57 Computer Mainterance & Repair % Ja00 % 1801 % 1600 % 3201 5 (299 913%
10-83-6052 Furniture & Cffice Equipment 5 200 % 98 & 1M % 200 3 £ 1005
10-83-6053 Leases-Cffice Equipmant 5 4000 % 1990 % 1934 % 30924 5 {7} R
10-B3-B055 Printing & Postage 5 1100 % 470 B30 % 1,100 5 . 1004
10-83-B056G Rapair Office Equipment 5 250 % - % or 3 a0 & [130) A0
10-83-8057 Telaphona 5 3000 % 26838 % 1.632 % 4,268 § 1,268 142%
10-53-8059 Office Supplies 5 2800 5 1.828 % 72 % ZB00 5 - 100%
10-83-5071 Bldg Mainterance & Supply 5 1,000 5 g4 3 400 & TE4 5 (2343} Ta%
10-83-5072 Heat & Electic b B840 3§ 2370 % 3400 3 57708 (870 87%
10-83507s Wehcle Ops-Gas k3 9a0 5 485 % 500 3 995 & 95 111%
ki 50 5 425 5 500 5 928 & 425 186%

10-83-5078 ahicle Rapairs & Maintenanca
e Expenditure Total | 8T 328588 %




City of Harrington - Police Dept
Budget Va. Actual - Dacember, 2014

Account d " TAccount Desc n T ens Budgeted 2045 Actual T B Month Est” " “Total 6 Over Budget % of Budget 1

Ravenues:

10-20-24201 Peoiica Fines H 285000 & 1E2ATE & 145182 & 503 5 20,000 I

10-20-4202 Finger Prints/Reports Incoms ] 1300 & 925§ s o § 3,300 5 . 0%,

1D ED-M:IE F‘a}.-rc-ll Remhufs:e“uents Salan.r 3 - % 340 & -} 340 5 540 0%,
P 2% r. o 0,d '.'

Exnencnures

0-E0-5001 Salarios 3 435,668 3§ 268,189 & 263833 % H10,027 & 74,360 1050
*0-20-5002 Dwartimea 3 10,30 3 2028 % 5000 % I 2,97 T
10-20-5022  SEUCT 3 11,473 § 47 3 62,532 § 11,828 & [ 100%
10-20-5051 FICA 5 47211 5 22857 % 8413 3 AR T 15,256} a5y
10-20-5052 Olrver FIR Taxes 5 28E50 5 19167 3 12852 3 3ZNe % 3,450 112%
10-20-5053  Slale Uremployment Tax 5 5505 5 182§ 5266 3 5433 3 1G] 85%,
10-20-5071  Pansion 5 28,340 5 “3.AR8 3 11,785 3 25431 3 {2,307] 90%
10-20-5072 Health Insurance 5 126,866 5 He a0y % s6865 § 0862 3 {15,704 EE
10-20-5074 Cihar Mead Expenzes § RGO = 5 a5 1 . 100%
10-20-2082  Uniferm Sleaning H 1,200 5 3368 3 Ta4 8 1100 % {100) BE%
10-20-8002 Advartising B 250 & - 3 260§ 260 % £ 1003
10-20-2003 Commercial Insurance 3 2250 & A 714 3 4266 § 12980 % 4,730 1575
10-20-2007 Dues, Licenzes & Membsrzhips k7 aog & 260§ 440 5 i1 (1] 8%
10-20-8011  SeminarsTraining 5 200 & - 8§ 205 20§ (5,0 17%
10-20-6012 Travel & Foad b 1200 % 24 5 975 5 1200 % Q 100,
10-20-6013 Cleanirg Servizas $ 3.250 % 1828 § 1825 § 3260 3 i 100%
1C-20-B051 Compuler & Saflware i o F 237 8 83 § 0 3 u] 100%
1C-20-G051 Leaza Equiprant Expenss k] 3000 0§ B84 § 1000 & 16864 3 (1.318) G6%
1C-2C-G054  Misc Expenza 3 2000 § 12 & fads & 2000 8 4] 10C%
10-20-6055  Prntng & Postage i 1.200 % KT iy & 121 5 1 10C%
10-20-6057 Telezhone i 2800 F THEOG & TECS & 165206 5 2,706 122%
10-20-B058 Office Supplies H 300 % 981 % 231% % 3300 5 o 100%
10-20-80G8 Lagal Faes 3 1500 % 1906 & 406§ 2312 5 g1z 154%
10-20-6071 Buitding Mairl % Suoply 3 2500 % 2138 % Gz ok 2500 1§ o 100%
10-20-6072 Haat & Elaciric 3 12,800 % 5710 § 70681 F 12,300 § (18] 100%
10-20-6073 Mzinierance Agresmerts 3 san 3 qad ok - & 550§ - 0%
10-20-8075  Wehicle Oos-Gas 3 40,200 5 18619 § 21581 F 40,200 5 L] 100%
10-20-6C75  Wehicle Repairs & Malrtenarce 5 10,000 5 4608 G349 % 10,00 5 (0 100
0-E0-B201 Chalhing Allcwarce 5 10,200 5 2392 % 4507 % T2 5 {3,000 1'%
10-Z0-5204 Radar & Elecironics 5 2,50 5 GE% % 1511 % 2E00 5 - 100%

3 3 ¥ i 5 1. :IIZIII,I 'BIZI%

10-20-5207 Amm::n"l'arg.vats.'WaanDn T alnlng
B R b e i



City of Harrington - Public Works
Budget Vs, Actual - December, 2014

50% of Budget

Account Id " Account Description 2015 Budgeted 2015 Actual & Month Est Total % Over Budget % of Budget |
Revenues:
10-30-4301 TME Revanua Recaived 5 - 8 40 & - % 47 % 40 0%
10-30-4507 Transfar From Capital Reserve 5 25000 % - & 25000 % 254000 % = 0%
10-30-4510 Intarfund Raceipt - Watar 5 T.2E7 8 - % T227T % 7227 % - 0%
10-30-4511 Interfund Receipt - Sewer b 28711 & Y AL 2871 % =
B Reventie T otal M S AT o35 S A0 S 6T 938 WS T S IR0 (T

Budget Dlstnbutlnn 2R3, 412 3 24? 201 § I1E 21 1]
A Revene Total N 825,350 18 A0 S 6,938 T 308,179 78 1 (325,310)
Expenditures:
10-20-5004 Salares - 107,391 & 52,223 5 54,783 5 106993 & (393) 100%
10-30-5002 Overtime 3 6325 % 2297 5 3181 % S460 % (BBS5) 6%
10-20-5002 Per Cigrm : 2080 % 1,040 3 1,040 % 2030 3% - 100%
10-30-5051 FICA 5 5699 % 4,152 § 4432 % 5584 5 115 99%;
10-30-5052 Cihar FiR Tanes 3 6338 % 4235 3§ 2864 % 7102 5 TE4 112%
10-30-5053 State Unemploymeant Tax 5 1582 § G & 1,227 § 1,233 5 (343 TEY
10-30-5071 Pension 3 5774 % 4405 § 2825 § 7.030 5 1.256 122%
10-30-5072 Haalth Inzurarce 5 24111 & 15,958 & 14,733 & 3069 5 B.58I[ 127%
10-30-5074 Dther Med Expensas 5 300 % - 3 = % - 5 (3cm 0%
10-30-5083 Uniform Cleaning/Purchasa 5 4,830 % 3445 % 3445 % 6,006 5 2,348 152%
10-30-B005 Commerzial Insurance ] 2900 % 1821 % 1738 % 36808 5 T8 124%
10-3C-601 1 SeminarsTraining 3 200 % 75 4 125 % 200 5 - 100%,
10-3C-6012 Travel & Focd 5 380 B 122 % 228 % 350 & [0 T00%
10-3C-6051 Camputar & Softwarg b - 5 & % - 5 a & | 04
10-30-6053 Lease Equipment Expanze i 400 5 = F = - 5 (400 0%
10-30-B054 Misc Expense b - 5 126 & - 5 126 & 125 0%
10-30-6057 Telephons 5 2700 5 1233 & 1.283 B 2566 % (134} Q5%
10-30-6059 Cffice Supplias 3 400 & 93 5 1k & 1493 & (207 48%
10-30-G0EG Engineering F 12,500 § 203 % 787 5 1,000 & (11,5217 2%
10-30-B071 Building Maint & Supoly § 16800 % 7L S 70§ 1480 % (120 B2,
10-30-6072 Heat & Electic % 4,310 % 1,873 3 1,973 5 3046 % [304) 1%
10-30-B075 Wahicke Ops-Gas k3 12,000 3 7.221 5 000 5 12221 % 221 102%
10-30-6076 Wahicle Rapairs & Maintenance : 2000 & 3073 3 927 3 4,000 & 2,000 200%
10-30-E077 License & Pernitz b3 200 % - 3 200 % 200 % - 1040%
10-30-8301 Construction Equip Ops 3 5000 % 4,050 3 950 & 5,000 % 0 100%
10-30-6302 Construction Equip Maint I 6,000 % 6675 3 G675 § 7380 % 1,350 122%
10-30-8302 Ditah Tax, Clean, Maint - 3,000 % 2874 § 126 % aoon % 0 100%
10-30-5304 Snow Removal 5 3000 % - 1,000 % 1.000 % 12,0007 33%
10-30-5308 Street Lights 8 57,800 & 25,887 & 28,857 & 53774 % {3,7263 4%
10-30-5306 Street Maint 5 35,000 % 8350 % 20000 % 28350 3 (6,650} 81%
10-30-5307 Street Signs and Markings 3 00 % 81 % 119 & soe 3 oy 100%
10-30-5308 Supplies, Tocls & Misc Pars 3 3000 % 689§ 1000 % 1,688 5 (1,311 56%
10-30-6310 Wildlifa Conlral 5 2000 % - % 1,000 & 1,000 3 1,000 a0%
10-30-5311 Sarety 5 1.050 % - % 500 % B 5 (550} 48%
10-30-5651 Sewer Line Maintenance i Zono 3 2':1 i 1,000 % 'I.EE{I 5 (9&0) 5%
1L0-30-5652 Chamicals 3 3 i - 5 5 24 0%
B it ol 28 58078 TSG04 TS T8 08478 T8 T Ty s




City of Harrington - Library
Budget Vs, Actual - December, 2014

Bccount 1d 7 Account Description '2015 Budgeted " 2015 Actual |~ 6Month Est  Total " § OverBudget % of Budgst |
FEvanuas:
10-40-410% Misc Income § Z g5 0§ 4 5 100 5 100 (1
10-40-4118 Donations § - 5 50 3 - 8 50 8 54 5
10-40-4401 Liorary State Grant 5 aroc & 7403 5 - 5 37403 5 403 101%
1 C-40-4402 F-‘.mp*r:-cal Borrowing 5 35000 8§ 22098 § 12,904 5§ Ja,000 & - 100%
10-40-4403 ) i L 5000 5 3129 § 1129 § 6,255 5 1,258 125%
[0 GENERAL FUND Revenio Total 17§ T I77,000 778 W62,774 178 06,0378 1T, 011 8 1A BT A0z
Eudget Dlstrbutlnn i 99,41t § H 94,453 5 (4,858} 5%
I Risveiniia Total = 701 AT AT S B2 74 S T A,037 8 TTATa 265 TS I N(3 146y T -1
Expenditures;
10-40-5001 Salaries 5 85,738 & 44771 & 48924 § 03,695 § 12,0449 R
10-40-5051 FlCA 3 7T.A24 % 1337 % 3741 % T8k F 1244) 7%
10-40-5052 Clher 205 Taxes 5 922 3 616 % 414 3 1032 % 110 112%
10-40-5053 Slate Unemployment Tax 5 1,550 % 210 % 1163 % 1433 % (117 92%
10-40-5071 Pansion 5 4,448 % 3141 3% 1.B15 % 4755 & 307 107%
10-40-5072 Health Insurance 5 17,713 & 2.030 3 5783 3§ 17823 & o 101%
10-40-5002 Adverising 5 185 & 1689 3 - § 150 § 3] 97 %
10-40-5008 Commarsial Insurance b 1800 3 728 5 11§ 1438 5 {B1) B8%
10-40-5007 Cues, Licansas & Memberships 5 2005 - 8 200§ 200 5 = 1003
10-40-5011 SeminarsTraining 3 5 - 5 320 & kel - - 190%
10-40-5012 Trave! & Food b 00 5 - 5 a0 5 0 5 - 10305
10-40-5052 Furniturz & Equip Purchase ] 200 & - 5 200 5 208 . 1009
10-40-5053 Lease Equipment Expenzea $ 2200 % 637 & 681 5 1,318 5 Ba2) B0%
10-40-5055 Printing & Postaga 3 00 0§ 10 % 190 § 200 5 a 100%;
10-40-G055 Ragair - Cifica Equip 3 120§ - % a0 & a0 & - 100%;
10-40-B057 Telephone 3 1,550 % 692 3 1400 % 2093 % 543 135%
10-40-6053 Office Supplies 3 2200 % 337 0% 1000 % 1,337 § 1853; £1%
10-40-6071 Building Maint & Supply 5 3000 % G0 % 23 % 3000 % - 100%
10-40-6072 Heat & Electric 5 12,300 % 4,398 & 7o O% 12,300 & - 100%
10-40-6402 Bocks, Videa & Matanals 5 23000 % 6925 % 16,075 S 23,000 % - 100%
5 1,500 % 231 E 1.269 1,500 % 100%

1l:]-4D-E.4-:]3 Speclal P*ngramb

L ATe AN TS 7592 s 07,372 !.___!.._m"iﬂ"r!m""'@ﬂ@” Y




City of Harrington - Trash
Budget Vs. Actual - December, 2014

Accountld ~ " Account Descripion T 2015 Budgated

Revenues:

10-50-4108 Trasr Banaly & Interes 5 A0 § a5 i 925 % 1,850 & {rany %
*0-50-15M TrElEI' FEIEEI S 239392 3 12? 812 5 112.6%’5‘ $ 240, -1IZ| 5 744d 0%
Expendiiures:

10-80-20085 Commercial Insurance L 2452 0§ THMS 1631 % 452 0§ it 100
10-50-8055 Prirtng & Poastags ] S0 0§ 498 3 498 & 2} 100%:
10-50-6501 Contractzed Trash Sarvices ] 228,288 & 105431 5 118.B57 3 228288 & - 1009

¥

10-50-6502 Ssnﬂanon Bulh: Trash Plclwn

9?52 5 3,750 5 50030 3 a7h2 & H] 1001%;
; i {15,500 & T A264e1 5 241900 § T o0%




City of Harrington - Fire Dept
Budget Vs, Actual - December, 2014

Aceount 1d 77 Account Description 204

Rewvenuas:
10-82-4101 F{embur&:—ment Flre Dapt k4 61 562 5
. Revenue SRR W e R e KRR L

gart Dk

8

33,472 5

22, 351 5? 933 $

e
Expendituras:

10-82-5001 Salarias 5 71,003 % 220§ B2t 5 72801 % 1,498 102%
10-82-5002 Cwvertime b1 1,000 3578 % JE00 3 7ATE % (AB2E G54
10-82-5051 FICA § 5431 % 2878 % 3743 % 6,621 & 1.180 122%
10-52-5052 Other P/R Taxes i 4581 % 3063 % 2070 % 5,133 3 552 112%
10-82-5053 State Unemploymeant Tax £ 925 § - % a5z § 62 5 [64] 93%
10-82-5071 Fension 5 J858 § 2,738 & 1568 § 4327 & 662 118%
10-82-5072 Heaalth Insuranace ] 23122 § BETI 5 gs52 % 18,525 & (4,587) BO%
10-82-6005% COMMERCIAL INSURANCE B 2820 3 B4 5 358 5 TiO& (1,900 2T%

$ 3,00'3 ] H 5 ; b -

10-B2-6101 Fuel Hmrnbursement—Flre Dapt
TR ) e ] al




City of Harrington - Parks & Recreation
Budget Vs. Actual - December, 2014

Account "TAzcount Description 015 Budgeted 2015 Actual T Month Est | Total | § Over Budget | % of Budget ]
Rawvaruas:
10-20-4801 Grant-In-&id 5 i3.00c % 16,000 § 17,000 &% Japooc 3 - 1008
10804802 Fundraisers 5 37a00 3 10,868 & 26132 % 3rooc 3 = 1%
10-80-4803 R.E Frice Jr Comm Center 5 10,275 § 5100 & 5.1 ?5 3 10275 % . 1%
10-20-4208 Baskelball 5 1,500 5 4515 § i 4515 3 3,098 A01%
10-830-4810 Darce 5 12570 5 10,194 % 2 -’-?E- 3 12,670 3 o 100
10-80-4811 Fiald Hockey/Lacrossa § 4,300 § B35 § 461 3 4300 3 - 100%
10-g0-4342 Poao Warner Cneerlzading 3 10,760 8 11818 § - 3 1M,26 5 1186 111%
10-A0-43° 3 Pop Warner Foatoall i 15000 & 10684 F 5 1588 § (4,216] T
10-A0-4314 Succer E] LRI 15,583 § 15.55!] 5 31,166 3 4,855 1135
0-80-48145 Tennis 3 560 5 545 § - 8 545 § (15] 7%
10-80-4315 Tumbling!Gymrastcs i SAC0 3 -8 hdl § ‘nﬂ 5 {4 FI':,'CI] 1" "u
10-B0-4819 W e,uung 3 - 3 TEC 5 5 5
W‘”WWL i3 56,725 18 B0 4210 TS TS 5\“:" ﬁmzmu;::; 4,...?1119?51
15030 5 2077 8 21

T Tss T I e a2 NS TRT AT0 TS TN e BeT TS ‘.".""".,&Emuaﬂ_._ A T

Expandiluras:
10-8C-5001 Salaries i 50,429 3 295581 % WA % segeEl 3 431 101 %
10-40-5051 FICA 5 4546 § 2175 & 2119 % 4,424 % 152) 9%,
10-80-5052 Other A/R Taxes § KT 285 % 179 3 A4 F 60 113%
10-8-5053 State Unemployment Tax H 828 § 127 ¥ TEL % g5 % 14 9h%
10-80-2071 Penslan H 2241 § 2074 & 1186 % 3260 % 319 T
10-30-53072 Health Insurarce ¥ 13,000 5 7930 & a SES 3 16233 3 3,231 126%
10-A0-6002 Adverising B 100 & - % 1 :? (100) 0%
10-R0-6005 Commercia insurarca ¥ B000 § 1457 & 1.-’-:]!:- -] Z.BET 3 13,113 18%
10-20-6051 Compuier & Sofware E - § 5 % a0 [ 5 ned
10-80-8053 Laase Equipment Expanse } 3400 F 48 F g9z 3 1338 % 12,062 300t
10-B0-G055 Prirlirg & Paslage i 250 % 168 3 a1 5 2680 % v 1000
10-80-6057 Teaphane 3 2800 F 1,212 % 1,326 § 2538 § 138 TE%
10-80-6058 Cllice Supplies E ] 400 & 162 § 2375 400 5 MK 100%
10-R01-60 7 Bullzing Maint & Supoly 3 1500 % 10615 439 5 1,500 % Pl 100%:
0-80-6072 Heat & Electric H o0 § 3359 § 5541 5 10,000 3 a 00
10-80-6073 Mairtenance Agreemeants 5 JE1H{ M- 1 a53 5 149 5 1081 5 181 1205,
10-B0-6075 Vehicle Ops-Gas 5 250 % T8 8 100§ 1VE 8 [7d] 1%
10-B0-G075 Vehicle-Repaira & Mainienance 5 o0 3 JoE § 15 5 an 5 ] 16015
10-B0-GHC Baskelball E 1.600 3 143 & - § 143 5 1,357) 100%
10-B0-6ACE Fungraisers 5 1,000 3 20t & 4886 & ARV -] () 100%
10-B0-6804 RE Froa-Bleg Maint & Supplies 5 a0 3 3§ 100 % 13 & B19) 175
10-80-6805 RE Prea-Heat & Electric ] 3500 5 1243 % 1,243 & 2495 3 (1,002) 1%
N-B0-6E0E RE Prce-Dapeosii Reimbursa 5 q{lu 5 250 % 50 % GO0 § - 100%
10-B0-EBOT Fiald Rert - 5. Bernadehe's Chur § 5 1085 % 18935 & 34970 F 3870 0%
T 0-BO-GE1CD Cance ] 1D.5.']EI 3 4050 F 68450 F 10800 G 1005
t0-B0-E511 Fiale Hockeylacrosae 3 1400 8 ave 3 421 3 1400 & [ 100
10-A0-5812 Poo wWamer Creeread ng ¥ TEOD R THEE & - % Tass § KLt 105%
10-B0-5612 Pea Warrar Foaloall ¥ 12000 & 4847 & -} 4847 % [7.163) AC%
10-80-2514 Soaoer 1 15000 § 517 § 5821 % 15,000 % a 100%,
10-80-2512 Tenniz ] I ] 207 % 113 3 320 % [y A0G%,
10-20-2814 Tuml:ling-'Grnnasﬁ-:s 1 250 % -5 RGO % R0 & 00%,
P otal 1 AT 755 T8 T84 368 TS 60,489 T §57778 I 888 T 86




City of Harrington - Planning & Inspections
Budget Vs, Actual - December, 2014

305 Aciual 6 Manih Est T

0% of Eudqq1
. of Budget

Rawenuas:

10-24-41 7% Zuning Code Vizlavons 5 B 170 3 3 100 % 100 0%,
10-8d-L 167 Flerning & Insaeclions Rey ] 1800 R 325 0§ s 5 G50 5 (28500 19%,
A0ead-4181 Bulaing Periils it A4q00 ¥ 18 BIE 3 1Mo 5 28608 5 15,208 0G5
10-34-4 182 £00 Faos 5 4000 F EMs & 1,280 & G555 5§ 2565 T
“0-g4-4 183 Grags Cubing % 5000 3F 14540 5 100 & 15,040 5 10,040 0
10-Gd-4184 acan: Baldings 3 #4500 3 6 5 585 § S [T.onoy 183%
10-Rd-4185 Ciby Clean Up Faes f 11630 5 24667 8§ 1ma % 1834 % {7865 AR
10-Bd—4 A6 Coatraalors Licensa b 1 laous 5 13402 & 8 % 1250C % {5,100} T4
10-B4-4147 Buginess Licerse 3 21,000 5 16985 § [ 3 17088 % 13,008} Bt
10-B4-41 38 Rantal Licenss 3 SRODT B 35013 % 180 % 5169 % !E.H-'_'p!_'; BE
10-84-4194. Frofessicnal Fee Billing 3 2. :]r"-:l k3 13/ & e i 2 ma F 100%
Iranafer lr.m Rumrrue.ElF' 3 BAO000 % L3 Eaann 3 W 16,000 130%
F 5 RS | ﬂ%"‘_nﬁ..i'*"” nmﬁmmmmm
Expandiuras
10-84-5001 Szanes 5 3338 3 1558 3 17003 35 a55681 3 41 101%
A0-84-5081 F A 3 2540 3 1,266 3 1301 5 2569 3 13 101%
TG-G4-50E2 Ceker BIR Taxas £ 1831 3 1236 3 1,238 5 2472 3 f82l 134%
10-54-5083 Slere Unemployment Tax L] 4683 5 125 426 § 447 5 {61 99%
10-6d4-5071 Pansicn H 1,695 3 1163 § T3 & 1676 § 181 1%
10-B4.5072 Heal:n Insurance 3 - 5 63 5 X 126 5 128 1
10-84-EC82 Prolesscnal Sevalapmees 3 aop 5 10 5 E 1 102§ {399) 205
10-84-E033 Urifoerr Clesaning 3 10: 5 - & £ - & 100% it
10-84-5108 Frofessicnal Contractual Accling Fees 3 1000 % - & - % - & (1,0000 05
11-84-4005 Cammercial Irsuranca 3 1873 B 1,082 % 1092 % 2784 % a0g 173
10-4-a007 Duee. Liceraes & Merberships 3 - F 18 & - % 15 % 15 34
10-084-5017 SaminersTraning 5 LT LI i 40 % (210 163
12-84-6012 Travel & Frad 5 DI 4 o R 4 i 2% § (71 20%
10-84-6051 Carpuinr & Sofiwara 5 - 3 i1 - 3 i B 3 o
10-d4-6053 Leasy Ecuipmens Experse H 1000 % FE=1 I 495 3 ek {4y 100r%,
10-34-6055 Printng & Fostage & 1,000 3 12 3 200 3 62 % [R1H e
AC-84-6D57 Taleghnane b 1,250 3 E25 3 §26 3 1,250 % D 100
10-A4-GOEY Cffica Supplias ] 700 35 E29 3 28 3 1,258 % 550 160%
T0-B4-GIEG Engineering ¥ 3000 5 1435 35 1485 5 2970 % (33 %
10-B4-8072 Hear & Elzeiric k3 1660 5 gz 5 For 5 1,164 3 (478 T
10-B4-BC 75 Wahicle Ops-Gas F 1,500 § 5518 561 5 1,102 3 3548 1%
10-B4-E0TE Wuhicle Rapairs & Maintanence ] 150 & 19 § 200§ 219. 8 B 146%
10-B4-£1d1 Bailding Farmits 3 20000 & 19,855 § 16000 § JEsa 5 14 854 174%
10-R4-818% Gress Cuting 3 g % 2370 0§ 1500 & 3670 § B 129%,
10-04-2185 City Clean Up Fees 3 1000 % - % - % -« 8 {1,000 0%
10-84-5187 Contracted Cily Flanning 3 o000 % 15,008 & 15,000 % 0008 § 9,992) AW URS
10-84-5 158 P1£Ir‘.'I|'|‘ipr-|J Ruull:m' 5 oo % 31,935 % ARG % 52750 B 22750 176%



City of Harrington - Water
Budget Vs, Actual - December, 2014

Accountid | Account Description T 2015 Budgeted | 2015 Actual "6 Month Est Total 7 _$ Over Budget % Of Buidgat |
Favenuss:
20-50-4003 Rent Incame 3 16,700 & BSTD & 8623 % 17,183 % 493 103%
30-G0-4108 Watsr Penzalties 5 2500 8 1427 5 1427 5 2,854 3% 354 114%
30-63-4110 Interest income £ 4,000 % 4430 3 3800 % 723 & 3,239 181%
A0-60-4800 Water Revenuea $ 324657 F 257002 F ZETHES §F 624 65T % i) 100445
30-50-4803 Water Hook-up Fees 5 2,000 & 2866 & 1,200 % 4066 § 1,086 136%
30-50-4504 Watar OnfOff CHP Fees 2 G50 & 805 & 400 % 1.206 % 255 127%
30-B0-45605 Water OnfOff Sarvice Fees 3 6000 % 3810 % 3510 % w020 % 1,020 117%
A0-60-4700 Water Impact Fees 5 g 3510 3 5 3510 % 3,510 0%
B TR Revenue Total SumuE T | el § BLlE 557 auL$ 28121978 ;us,szs C$USeTT4ATS T 9937 oz
Expenditures:
30-80-5001 Salarias 5 B2E45 § 34417 § 31943 F  BEIEE 3,721 106%
A0-60-5002 Crwerima ki 2300 % 1,518 % 1,150 % ZEEE % 359 116%
A0-60-5051 FICA b 44988 5 2748 3 2532 § 5281 & 33 106%
30-60-5052 Other PR Taxes % 3618 3 2418 3 1,634 3 4052 & 437 2%
30-60-50453 State Unemployment Tax % 868 % b H. 716 % 719 % (149 B3%
30-60-5071 Pension 5 3327 % 2185 & 1488 § 873 % 345 110%
30-60-5072 Health Insurance 3 19,325 % 8,930 % 8,934 3§ 17524 % {1,801} 9t
10-80-5005 Commercial Insurance £ 10,800 % 5,098 % 8000 § 10088 % (502 95%,
30-B0-5008 Contingancy ] 13,400 % = 3 13400 % 13400 % - 100%
30-60-8007 Duesg, Licenses & Memberships % 1000 5 428 3 572 8 1,000 % - 100%:
30-60-6011 Seminars & Training % 1,000 3 - 5 1,000 5 1,000 8§ - 100%
3i0-60-6055 Printing & Pastage g 2,000 % a17 & 800 3§ 1,217 5 (TE3) 1%
A0-60-6057 Telephars 3 400 & - & - & & 400} 0%
20-60-6058 Office Supolias i 400 % 224 % 17e § 4EIEI 3 o 100%
30-80-6088 Engineering b 19000 % BIA & 1,000 % 1608 & 13,383 11%
30-60-5071 Building Maint & Supply $ oo % - 5 300 % 00 % - T00%
30-60-8072 Heat & Electric $ 25000 5 10818 §F 10818 3 263 3§ (3.354) AT%
30-80-8073 Maintenance Agraements g 850 3 - 5 50 3 350 % {200 Fid %
30-80-8077 Licenses & Parmits z 200 % 100§ 100 & 200§ - 100%
a0-60-5308 Supplies, Tools & Misc Parts 5 1,500 % - ¥ 500 & BOO & {1,000 33%
30-60-6601 Equipment Mairtenarce 5 1,500 % 580 % 920 § 1,500 % 0 100%
30-60-6604 Water Meters 5 2,000 % 1,640 = 1,690 % 3380 % 1,380 189%
30-60-5605 Well Mairtenancs 5 5000 & - 3 2,600 % 2500 % (2,500 a0%
30-60-8850 Samgle Tasting 3 &00 8 457 § 457 & 914 & 114 1145
A0-a0-68551 Line Repairs g 10,000 3 2521 § 3000 3 5521 % [4,473) 5%
30-80-6852 Chemicals 3 10,000 % 6,368 5 B.AEE F 1313 5 2,136 131 %
30-60-6655 LISDA Loan #8 3 22268 % 11,134 % 11,134 § 22268 3 - 100%
20-80-6655 US0DA Loan #9 i 11,362 § 5678 & E678 & 11,362 % - 100%
30-G0-6657 USDA Loan #15 5 33492 F 16748 3 16748 § 0 33402 § - 100%
30-60-5008 CIP Contingencies $ 100,000 & - F 100,000 % 100,000 - 100%
30-80-8810 Interfund Sarvica Fee % 96,561 5 - F 9661 32 QIE- 561 :] 100%
SEI-ED G511 Transf&r ta Impact Fee Reserve 3 5 35810 5 % 3 z-1l:I (1%
e Tortal R e s m,lﬁf éEfﬁmJ__'ﬁlﬁﬂﬁ Smﬂmmf 5,.248) 9T
5 G, 436 F 121 E1’;‘l 3 25,183 126%
e — s

557,8071178 118,994 T $ 11327, 131 1§ 11567, 74418 N6, 937 IO




City of Harrington - Waste Water
Budget Vs, Actual - December, 2014

Aceolint 1d 171 AEEGURE Deserlption 171772015 Bldgated 17 "2015 Actial Dec 16 Month Est (T8 go) ! Tatal 171 I8 Gvar Budget /% of Bldgat ")
Revenues:
30-F0-4108 Sewer Penallles 3 11,200 3 4226 1 4,226 § 5452 35 [2,745) 7o
30-70-4110 Intarest Incoma i 400 % 126 3 204 % 400 5 {0} 100s
A0-70-4700 Sewer Ravenue 3 1623821 § BLas2 3 220109 % 1,823821 § i] 1005
30-70-4703 Sewer Hook-up Fees 3 - 5 1,700 3 1,700 % 3400 5 3,400 (K
30-70-4804 Sewar mpact E_EIES 3 7860 3 5 7560 5 7,060 (g
T T T Revenue Total . T TE T 635, 5i1 ~5 BiTA94 5 B26,23 239 R I Ak B I 5 I [} 3]
Expenditures:
30-TC-5001 Salaries 5 531695 5 25815 § 27385 % 53000 5 (G55 88%
A0-F0-5002 Cwerlima 5 2875 % 3634 5 143 % 5072 & 2,197 176%
30-70-5051 FICA ] 4328 § 2238 % 2205 % 4443 % 115 103%
30-70-5052 Other P/R Taxes k1 3152 % 2108 % 1423 % 3829 % T 112%
A0-70-5053 State Unemplayment Tax 3 7B § R 513 3 616 § [164) A%
A0-70-5071 Pensian 3 2ama % 1572 % 1304 % 3178 & 2598 110%
-70-5072 Health Insuranca 3 15950 % 7E35 § 73BT % 15022 % [928) O4%
30-70-5005 Commersizl Insuranze i 22749 % 13,108 3 12798 § 284807 % 3,158 114%
30-70-G006 Contingency 3 29300 % - % 29300 5§ 20,000 % - 100%
30-70-5011 Trainirg 3 1.000 % - % 1,000 3 1,000 % - 100%,
30-70-8055 Printing & Postage 3 2000 % 39 0§ S0 5 RG9S & (1,131} 43%
30-70-B057 Talapkona 3 1.000 3 442 % 422§ 534 % [1146; 58%
30-70-5055 Ofica Supplies 5 400§ 224 % 280§ 474 % 74 118%
30-70-5065 Erginsering 5 20,000 § 2130 § 7870 5§ 1noon % 10,000 50,
30-70-5058 Legal Feas 5 40,000 & 25427 § 25000 § 50,427 % 10,427 126%
30-70-6071 Building Maint & Supply 5 1,300 5 Gz 5 BLQ 3 GE2 3 (B35} 51%
30-¥FO-BLT2 Heat & Electric 3 2750 3 4153 5 4,500 5 8653 3 (1.127} 58%
30-TO-B073 Maintanance Agreaments 5 550 § - § 550§ 550 % - 100%
30-TO-BOTT License and Permnits 5 123 & 125 5§ - § 125 % - 1005
A0-7T0-8311 Safaty 5 1,500 5 = & 1,800 % 1500 3% B 100%
30-TO-E601 Equip Main 5 1800 % 1,352 § 245 & 1600 5 1] 100%,
30-TO-BH50 Sample Tasting 5 1000 % 280 % 280 % 520 5 1480) 52U,
30-TC-B551 Lina Repairs 5 500 & 334 5 166§ 500 3 1] 100%,
30-F-B552 Chemicals b S0C § - 5 520 % S04 3 1005
AD-TL-B558 UsDa Loan 26 5 42116 § 21052 5 21,058 § 42118 5 = 100%
A0-TL-B5539 UsDa Loan #10 ] 3658 §F 1,634 § 1.824 % 3E55 5 - 1002
A0-TL-G660 US04 Loan #1 k1 108080 § 24040 % 54040 § 108080 5 - 00
J0-TO-B561T LsDA #17 k1 59011 3 28514 % 20497 % 59.011 5 - 00
30-70-5562 SRFA0T 3 47830 3 21815 3 71815 § 47.820 § {o) 100%
A0-TO-H663 SEF#29 i 3ra1a 3 18,658 § 18,655 & b e [ R Ha 1007
AL-TO-5664 SRF#a2 3 126,580 % 63,250 3§ 3,290 3 126,580 3 0 100
A0-70-570 County Sawer Faeg 3 4750040 & 184555 % 23,000 F 415255 § (59,145 223
0-70-5702 Purmp Station Maintznance 3 7000 % 4843 % 2151 % 000 5 i 10098
20-70-5703 Flow Meater Maintenance i B3 % - % BOC % B0 &
-70-5908 CIP Sther 3 114,403 & -3 114,402 % 114,423 § =
30-F0-5910 Interfund Sarvice Faa 3 30E,871 35 - 3 396971 3 306,871 % =

5 T 550 E - & 7,560 & 7,060

:3-:] ?L‘I-EQ'I'I Transfer to Im Fea Hes 3

01,585,304 1§ 150,217

58430 § 3,430




	2015.02.09 CC WS_agd
	2015.02.09 CC WS_pkt

